
 

Income Disclosure Statement 

The income statistics below are for all Nücleogenex affiliates who were eligible to qualify for 
commissions in 2023. The average annual income for an Affiliate in 2023 was $2,504.00 

Affiliate 

In 2023, 48.9% of Affiliates qualified as an unranked Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $228.37. On average, unranked Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 17 months. 

Jade Affiliate 

In 2023, 3.95% of Affiliates qualified as a Jade Affiliate. The average annual income of these Jade 
Affiliates, for 2023, was $355.83, On average, Jade Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 22 

months. 

Jade Level 1 Affiliate 

In 2023, 4.87% of Affiliates qualified as a Jade Level 1 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $315.87. On average, Jade Level 1 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 23 months. 

Jade Level 2 Affiliate 

In 2023, 5.7% of Affiliates qualified as a Jade Level 2 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $629.34. On average, Jade Level 2 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 26 months. 

Jade Level 3 Affiliate 

In 2023, 2.59% of Affiliates qualified as a Jade Level 3 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $925.38. On average, Jade Level 3 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 26 months. 

Pearl 



In 2023, 3.8% of Affiliates qualified as a Pearl Affiliate. The average annual income of these 
Affiliates, for 2023, was $676.27. On average, unranked Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex 

for 31 months. 

Pearl Level 1 Affiliate 

In 2023, 2.28% of Affiliates qualified as a Pearl Level 1 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $1415.30. On average, Pearl Level 1 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 29 months. 

Pearl Level 2 Affiliate 

In 2023, 3.19% of Affiliates qualified as a Pearl Level 2 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $1284.04. On average, Pearl Level 2 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 32 months. 

Pearl Level 3 Affiliate 

In 2023, 3.04% of Affiliates qualified as a Pearl Level 3 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $1751.48 On average, Pearl Level 3 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 33 months. 

Sapphire 

In 2023, 5.7% of Affiliates qualified as a Sapphire Affiliate. The average annual income of these 
Affiliates, for 2023, was $2166.74. On average, unranked Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex 

for 33 months. 

Sapphire Level 1 Affiliate 

In 2023, 2.59% of Affiliates qualified as a Sapphire Level 1 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $2150.39. On average, Sapphire Level 1 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 32 months. 

Sapphire Level 2 Affiliate 

In 2023, 4.64% of Affiliates qualified as a Sapphire Level 2 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $5232.35. On average, Sapphire Level 2 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 33 months. 

Sapphire Level 3 Affiliate 



In 2023, 1.9% of Affiliates qualified as a Sapphire Level 3 Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Affiliates, for 2023, was $13,254.69. On average, Sapphire Level 3 Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 31 months. 

Ruby Affiliate 

In 2023, 1.44% of Affiliates qualified as a Ruby Affiliate. The average annual income of these 
Ruby Affiliates, for 2023, was $5093.89 On average, Ruby Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex 

for 33 months. 

Ruby Level 1 Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.46% of Affiliates qualified as a Ruby Level 1Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Ruby Level 1Affiliates, for 2023, was $8930.69 On average, Ruby Level 1Affiliates have 

been with Nücleogenex for 37 months. 

Ruby Level 2 Affiliate 

In 2023, 1.22% of Affiliates qualified as a Ruby Level 2Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Ruby Level 2Affiliates, for 2023, was $3892.37. On average, Ruby Level 2Affiliates have 

been with Nücleogenex for 37 months. 

Ruby Level 3 Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.61% of Affiliates qualified as a Ruby Level 3Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Ruby Level 3Affiliates, for 2023, was $14,111.77  on average, Ruby Level 3 Affiliates have 

been with Nücleogenex for 32 months. 

Emerald Affiliate 

In 2023, 1.06% of Affiliates qualified as an Emerald Affiliate. The average annual income of these 
Emerald Affiliates, for 2023, was $13,210.73. On average, Emerald Affiliates have been with 

Nücleogenex for 37 months. 

Emerald Level 1 Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.61% of Affiliates qualified as an Emerald Level 1 Affiliate. The average annual income 
of these Emerald Level 1 Affiliates, for 2023, was $43,871.85. On average, Emerald Level 

1Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 34 months. 

Emerald Level 2 Affiliate 



In 2023, 0.46% of Affiliates qualified as an Emerald Level 2 Affiliate. The average annual income 
of these Emerald Level 2 Affiliates, for 2023, was $22,338.11. On average, Emerald Level 

2Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 39 months. 

Emerald Level 3 Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.23% of Affiliates qualified as an Emerald Level 3 Affiliate. The average annual income 
of these Emerald Level 3 Affiliates, for 2023, was $5246.93. On average, Emerald Level 3 

Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 34 months. 

Diamond Level 1 Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.08% of Affiliates qualified as a Diamond Level 1 Affiliate. The average annual income 
of these Diamond Level 1 Affiliates, for 2023, was $24,214.20. On average, Diamond Level 1 

Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 43 months. 

Diamond Level 2 Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.08% of Affiliates qualified as a Diamond Level 2 Affiliate. The average annual income 
of these Diamond Level 2 Affiliates, for 2023, was $25,466.58. On average, Diamond Level 2 

Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 37 months. 

Diamond Level 3 Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.30% of Affiliates qualified as a Diamond Level 3 Affiliate. The average annual income 
of these Diamond Level 3 Affiliates, for 2023, was $130,271.38. On average, Diamond Level 3 

Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 30 months. 

Pink Diamond Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.15% of Affiliates qualified as a Pink Diamond Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Pink Diamond Affiliates, for 2023, was $126,237.17. On average, Pink Diamond Affiliates 

have been with Nücleogenex for 40 months. 

Red Diamond Affiliate 

In 2023, 0.08% of Affiliates qualified as a Red Diamond Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Red Diamond Affiliates, for 2023, was $3937.74. On average, Red Diamond Affiliates have 

been with Nücleogenex for 40 months. 

Yellow Diamond Affiliate 



In 2023, 0.08% of Affiliates qualified as a Yellow Diamond Affiliate. The average annual income of 
these Yellow Diamond Affiliates, for 2023, was $130,847.33. On average, Yellow Diamond 

Affiliates have been with Nücleogenex for 43 months. 

 


